
Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1494104
Vendor Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0336407
Check Amount: $ 757.60
Check Date: 3/4/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 600049750
Invoice Date: 2/24/2025
PO Number: B0002467
Voucher Number: V0874914

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Mon, Feb 24, 2025 at 10:04 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay Kennicott's B0002467

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Gonzalez, Gabriel <gonzalezg147@cod.edu>

BCC:

Please process the attached invoice ok to pay Kennicott’s B0002467 invoice 600049750 $373.27, thank 
you, Amy Hull

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Monday, February 24, 2025 4:03 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

0825_001.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1494104
Vendor Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0336407
Check Amount: $ 757.60
Check Date: 3/4/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 600052390
Invoice Date: 2/27/2025
PO Number: P0016063
Voucher Number: V0874916

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Thu, Feb 27, 2025 at 10:43 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay P0016063 Kennicott

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Chapa, Hilary <chapah@cod.edu>

BCC:

Ok to pay P0016063 Kennicott $279.42, invoice #600052390

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Thursday, February 27, 2025 4:40 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

0830_001.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1494104
Vendor Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0336407
Check Amount: $ 757.60
Check Date: 3/4/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 200073662
Invoice Date: 2/27/2025
PO Number: P0016062
Voucher Number: V0874915

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Thu, Feb 27, 2025 at 10:46 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay Kennicott P0016062

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Chapa, Hilary <chapah@cod.edu>

BCC:

ok to pay Kennicott P0016062, $104.91, invoice #200073662

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Thursday, February 27, 2025 4:40 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

0831_001.pdf
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